



**M&M Service Company**

**CROP YEAR 16/17**

**Tuesday, June 27, 2017  
3:42:13 PM**

**TERMINAL BIDS**

CORN	DP RATES	JUNE 17	JULY 17	AUGUST 17
STL. MKT - BARGE LOADER	no charge, Price by Sep 30	3.60	3.60	3.62
CENTER ETHANOL - Sauget	NA	no bid	no bid	no bid
GREEN PLAINS	NA	no bid	3.50	3.59
ADM - Decatur	NA	3.63	3.63	3.69
BEST BN BID		3.46	3.46	
BARTLETT - S. Jacksonville		3.47	3.47	3.48

BEANS	DP RATES	JUNE 17	JULY 17	AUGUST 17
STL. MKT - BARGE LOADER	4 cents\month priced by Sep 30	9.15	9.20	9.25
ADM - Decatur	NA	9.09	9.09	

WHEAT	DP RATES	JUNE / JULY 17	AUG 17	SEP 17
STL. MKT - BARGE LOADER	7 cents\month priced by 03/31	4.65	4.64	4.68
MENNEL MILLING - Mt Olive	NA	4.71		

TERMINAL HOURS:	
ADM - STL	MON - FRI 6 am - 6 pm
ADM - SAUGET	CORN only MON - WED 5 am - 5 pm, closed THUR - FRI
CAHOKIA GRAIN - CAHOKIA	MON - FRI 5 am - 9 pm
LOUIS DREYFUS	MON - FRI 6 am - 6 pm
BUNGE SCF - FAIRMONT CITY	MON - FRI 6 am - 10 pm
CENTER ETHANOL - SAUGET	call for hours
GREEN PLAINS	call for hours...changes daily
BARTLETT - S. Jacksonville	call first
CHS - LOWDER RAIL	call first
SCOLAR - WAVERLY RAIL	call first
ADM - DECATUR CORN	FRI 6 am - 10 am, MON - WED 6 am - 6 pm
ADM - DECATUR BEANS	FRI - MON - WED 6 am - 4 pm
MENNEL MILLING - MT OLIVE	MON - SAT 7 am - 7 pm, SUN ???

CBOT CLOSSES:	CORN		BEANS		WHEAT	
	change	close	change	close	change	close
July 17	0.0025	3.5925	0.045	9.1125	0.0325	4.5325
August 17			0.0475	9.16		
September 17	0.005	3.6775	0.0475	9.1725	0.035	4.69
November 17			0.0375	9.175		
December 17	0.005	3.775			0.0325	4.9125
January 18			0.035	9.2525		
March 18	0.005	3.875	0.035	9.32	0.0225	5.0675
May 18	0.0025	3.9325	0.03	9.38	0.02	5.1775
July 18	0.005	3.99495	0.0275	9.4375	0.015	5.225



**M&M Service Company**

**CROP YEAR 16/17**

**ELEVATOR BIDS**

Free DP thru Aug 31 for new bushels across the scale. Must be priced while CME is trading

CORN	JUNE 17	JULY 17	AUGUST 17
Carlinville	3.32	3.32	3.34
Virden	3.39	3.39	3.32
Palmyra	3.36	3.36	3.32
Bunker Hill	3.37	3.37	3.39
Chesterfield	3.36	3.32	3.34
Girard	3.39	3.39	3.32
Thomasville	3.36	3.36	3.29
Irving	3.32	3.32	3.34
Barnett	3.34	3.34	3.37
Litchfield	3.34	3.34	3.37
Alhambra	3.37	3.37	3.39

Free DP thru Aug 31 for new bushels across the scale. Must be priced while CME is trading

BEANS	JUNE 17	JULY 17	AUGUST 17
Carlinville	8.80	8.85	8.90
Virden	8.78	8.83	8.88
Palmyra	8.78	8.83	8.88
Bunker Hill	8.85	8.90	8.95
Chesterfield	8.80	8.85	8.90
Girard	8.78	8.83	8.88
Thomasville	8.78	8.83	8.88
Irving	8.80	8.85	8.90
Barnett	8.83	8.88	8.93
Litchfield	8.83	8.88	8.93
Alhambra	8.87	8.92	8.97

**2017 wheat only**

WHEAT	JUNE / JULY 17	AUG 17
Carlinville	4.43	4.42
Virden	4.41	4.40
Palmyra	4.41	4.40
Bunker Hill	4.48	4.47
Chesterfield	4.43	4.42
Girard	4.41	4.40
Thomasville	4.41	4.40
Irving	4.43	4.42
Barnett	4.46	4.45
Litchfield	4.46	4.45
Alhambra	4.50	4.49



**M&M Service Company**

**CROP YEAR 17/18**

**Tuesday, June 27, 2017  
3:42:13 PM**

**TERMINAL BIDS**

<b>CORN</b>	<b>SEP 17</b>	<b>OCT / NOV 17</b>	<b>DEC 17</b>	<b>JAN 18</b>	<b>FEB 18</b>	<b>MAR 18</b>
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	3.60	3.66	3.82	3.90	3.92	3.93
CENTER ETHANOL - Sauget	no bid	3.73	3.85	3.93	3.95	3.96
GREEN PLAINS	3.59	3.69	3.79			
ADM - Decatur		3.71				
BEST BN BID	3.54	3.54	3.64	3.72		
BARTLETT - S. Jacksonville	3.52	3.51	3.66	3.71	3.74	3.76

<b>BEANS</b>	<b>OCT / NOV 17</b>	<b>DEC 17</b>	<b>JAN 18</b>	<b>FEB 18</b>	<b>MAR 18</b>
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	9.15	9.33	9.35		
ADM - Decatur	9.02				

<b>WHEAT</b>	<b>June / July 17</b>	<b>AUG 17</b>	<b>SEP 17</b>	
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	4.65	4.64	4.68	
MENNEL MILLING - Mt Olive	4.71	4.67	4.67	

<b>CBOT CLOSURES:</b>						
	<b>CORN</b>		<b>BEANS</b>		<b>WHEAT</b>	
July 17	0.0025	3.5925	0.045	9.1125	0.0325	4.5325
August 17			0.0475	9.16		
September 17	0.005	3.6775	0.0475	9.1725	0.035	4.69
November 17			0.0375	9.175		
December 17	0.005	3.775			0.0325	4.9125
January 18			0.035	9.2525		
March 18	0.005	3.875	0.035	9.32	0.0225	5.0675
May 18	0.0025	3.9325	0.03	9.38	0.02	5.1775
July 18	0.005	3.99495	0.0275	9.4375	0.015	5.225
August 18			0.03	9.4325		
September 18	0.0025	3.9525	0.0225	9.35	0.015	5.32
November 18			0.0075	9.3		
December 18	0	3.995			0.0125	5.46
January 19			0.0075	9.35		



**M&M Service Company**

**CROP YEAR 17/18**

**ELEVATOR BIDS**

<b>CORN</b>	<b>Sep / Oct / Nov 17</b>	<b>DEC 17</b>	<b>JAN 18</b>	<b>FEB 18</b>
Carlville	3.52	3.51	3.59	
Virden	3.52	3.54	3.62	
Palmyra	3.52	3.49	3.62	
Bunker Hill	3.42	3.59	3.67	
Chesterfield	3.52	3.51	3.59	
Girard	3.52	3.54	3.62	
Thomasville	3.49	3.51	3.59	
Irving	3.42	3.51	3.59	
Barnett	3.43	3.54	3.62	
Litchfield	3.43	3.54	3.62	
Alhambra	3.44	3.58	3.66	

<b>BEANS</b>	<b>Sep / Oct / Nov 17</b>	<b>DEC 17</b>	<b>JAN 18</b>	<b>FEB 18</b>
Carlville	8.86	8.99	9.01	
Virden	8.84	8.97	8.99	
Palmyra	8.84	8.97	8.99	
Bunker Hill	8.91	9.04	9.06	
Chesterfield	8.86	8.99	9.01	
Girard	8.84	8.97	8.99	
Thomasville	8.84	8.97	8.99	
Irving	8.86	8.99	9.01	
Barnett	8.89	9.02	9.04	
Litchfield	8.89	9.02	9.04	
Alhambra	8.93	9.06	9.08	

<b>WHEAT</b>	<b>June / July 17</b>	<b>AUG 17</b>	
Carlville	4.43	4.42	
Virden	4.41	4.40	
Palmyra	4.41	4.40	
Bunker Hill	4.48	4.47	
Chesterfield	4.43	4.42	
Girard	4.41	4.40	
Thomasville	4.41	4.40	
Irving	4.43	4.42	
Barnett	4.46	4.45	
Litchfield	4.46	4.45	
Alhambra	4.50	4.49	



**M&M Service Company**

**CROP YEAR 18/19**

**Tuesday, June 27, 2017**

**3:42:13 PM**

**TERMINAL BIDS**

<b>CORN</b>		OCT/NOV 2018			
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER		3.90			
CENTER ETHANOL - Sauget					
GREEN PLAINS					
ADM - Decatur					
BEST BN BID					
BARTLETT - S. Jacksonville					

<b>BEANS</b>		OCT/NOV 2018			
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER					
ADM - Decatur					

<b>WHEAT</b>		JUNE / JULY 2018			
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER					
MENNEL MILLING - Mt Olive					

<b>CBOT CLOSES:</b>						
	<b>CORN</b>		<b>BEANS</b>		<b>WHEAT</b>	
September 18	0.0025	3.9525	0.0225	9.35	0.015	5.32
November 18			0.0075	9.3		
December 18	0	3.995			0.0125	5.46
January 19			0.0075	9.35		
March 19	0.0025	4.07	0.0125	9.35	0.0125	5.5575



**M&M Service Company**

**CROP YEAR 18/19**

**ELEVATOR BIDS**

<b>CORN</b>		Sep / Oct / Nov 18			
Carlinville		3.70			
Virден		3.70			
Palmyra		3.70			
Bunker Hill		3.70			
Chesterfield		3.70			
Girard		3.70			
Thomasville		3.70			
Irving		3.70			
Barnett		3.70			
Litchfield		3.70			
Alhambra		3.70			

<b>BEANS</b>		Sep / Oct / Nov 18			
Carlinville		9.00			
Virден		9.00			
Palmyra		9.00			
Bunker Hill		9.00			
Chesterfield		9.00			
Girard		9.00			
Thomasville		9.00			
Irving		9.00			
Barnett		9.00			
Litchfield		9.00			
Alhambra		9.00			

<b>WHEAT</b>		JUNE / JULY 2018			
Carlinville					
Virден					
Palmyra					
Bunker Hill					
Chesterfield					
Girard					
Thomasville					
Irving					
Barnett					
Litchfield					
Alhambra					



CROP YEAR 16/17

CROP YEAR 16/17

Tuesday, June 27, 2017  
3:42:13 PM

**TERMINAL BASIS**

**ELEVATOR BASIS**

CORN	JUNE 17		JULY 17		AUGUST 17	
STL. MKT - BARGE LOADER	0.01	N17	0.01	N17	-0.06	U17
CENTER ETHANOL - Sauget	no bid	N17	no bid	N17	no bid	U17
GREEN PLAINS	no bid	N17	-0.09	N17	-0.09	U17
ADM - Decatur	0.04	N17	0.04	N17	0.01	U17
BEST BN BID	-0.13	N17	-0.13	N17		
BARTLETT - S. Jacksonville	-0.12	N17	-0.12	N17	-0.2	U17

BEANS	JUNE 17		JULY 17		AUGUST 17	
STL. MKT - BARGE LOADER	0.04	N17	0.09	N17	0.09	Q17
ADM - Decatur	-0.02	N17	-0.02	N17		

WHEAT	JUNE / JULY 17	
STL. MKT - BARGE LOADER	0.12	N17
MENNEL MILLING - Mt Olive	0.18	N17

CBOT symbol	=	Futures month
F	=	January
H	=	March
K	=	May
N	=	July
Q	=	August
U	=	September
X	=	November
Z	=	December

CORN	JUNE 17		JULY 17		AUGUST 17	
Carlville	-0.27	N17	-0.27	N17	-0.34	U17
Virden	-0.20	N17	-0.20	N17	-0.36	U17
Palmyra	-0.23	N17	-0.23	N17	-0.36	U17
Bunker Hill	-0.22	N17	-0.22	N17	-0.29	U17
Chesterfield	-0.23	N17	-0.27	N17	-0.34	U17
Girard	-0.20	N17	-0.20	N17	-0.36	U17
Thomasville	-0.23	N17	-0.23	N17	-0.39	U17
Irving	-0.27	N17	-0.27	N17	-0.34	U17
Barnett	-0.25	N17	-0.25	N17	-0.31	U17
Litchfield	-0.25	N17	-0.25	N17	-0.31	U17
Alhambra	-0.22	N17	-0.22	N17	-0.29	U17

BEANS	JUNE 17		JULY 17		AUGUST 17	
Carlville	-0.31	N17	-0.26	N17	-0.26	Q17
Virden	-0.33	N17	-0.28	N17	-0.28	Q17
Palmyra	-0.33	N17	-0.28	N17	-0.28	Q17
Bunker Hill	-0.26	N17	-0.21	N17	-0.21	Q17
Chesterfield	-0.31	N17	-0.26	N17	-0.26	Q17
Girard	-0.33	N17	-0.28	N17	-0.28	Q17
Thomasville	-0.33	N17	-0.28	N17	-0.28	Q17
Irving	-0.31	N17	-0.26	N17	-0.26	Q17
Barnett	-0.28	N17	-0.23	N17	-0.23	Q17
Litchfield	-0.28	N17	-0.23	N17	-0.23	Q17
Alhambra	-0.24	N17	-0.19	N17	-0.19	Q17

WHEAT	JUNE / JULY 17		AUG 17	
Carlville	-0.1	N17	-0.27	U17
Virden	-0.12	N17	-0.29	U17
Palmyra	-0.12	N17	-0.29	U17
Bunker Hill	-0.05	N17	-0.22	U17
Chesterfield	-0.1	N17	-0.27	U17
Girard	-0.12	N17	-0.29	U17
Thomasville	-0.12	N17	-0.29	U17
Irving	-0.1	N17	-0.27	U17
Barnett	-0.07	N17	-0.24	U17
Litchfield	-0.07	N17	-0.24	U17
Alhambra	-0.03	N17	-0.2	U17



**M&M Service Company**

Tuesday, June 27, 2017  
3:42:13 PM

**CROP YEAR 17/18**

**TERMINAL BIDS**

CORN	SEP 17	OCT / NOV 17	DEC 17	JAN 18	FEB 18	MAR 18
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	-0.08 U17	-0.12 Z17	0.04 Z17	0.02 H18	0.04 H18	0.05 H18
CENTER ETHANOL - Sauget	no bid U17	-0.05 Z17	0.07 Z17	0.05 H18	0.07 H18	0.08 H18
GREEN PLAINS	-0.09 U17	-0.09 Z17	0.01 Z17			
ADM - Decatur		-0.07 Z17				
BEST BN BID	-0.235 Z17	-0.235 Z17	-0.135 Z17	-0.155 H18		
BARTLETT - S. Jacksonville	-0.16 U17	-0.265 Z17	-0.115 Z17	-0.165 H18	-0.135 H18	-0.115 H18

BEANS	OCT / NOV 17	DEC 17	JAN 18	FEB 18	MAR 18
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	-0.03 X17	0.10 F18	0.10 F18		
ADM - Decatur	-0.16 X17				

WHEAT	June / July 17		
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	0.12 N17		
MENNEL MILLING - Mt Olive	0.18 N17		
ADM MILLING - STL			

CBOT symbol	=	Futures month
F	=	January
H	=	March
K	=	May
N	=	July
Q	=	August
U	=	September
X	=	November
Z	=	December

**CROP YEAR 17/18**

**ELEVATOR BASIS**

CORN	Sep / Oct / Nov 17	DEC 17	JAN 18	FEB 18
Carlinville	-0.26 Z17	-0.27 Z17	-0.29 H18	
Virden	-0.26 Z17	-0.24 Z17	-0.26 H18	
Palmyra	-0.26 Z17	-0.29 Z17	-0.26 H18	
Bunker Hill	-0.36 Z17	-0.19 Z17	-0.21 H18	
Chesterfield	-0.26 Z17	-0.27 Z17	-0.29 H18	
Girard	-0.26 Z17	-0.24 Z17	-0.26 H18	
Thomasville	-0.29 Z17	-0.27 Z17	-0.29 H18	
Irving	-0.36 Z17	-0.27 Z17	-0.29 H18	
Barnett	-0.35 Z17	-0.24 Z17	-0.26 H18	
Litchfield	-0.35 Z17	-0.24 Z17	-0.26 H18	
Alhambra	-0.34 Z17	-0.20 Z17	-0.22 H18	

BEANS	Sep / Oct / Nov 17	DEC 17	JAN 18	FEB 18
Carlinville	-0.32 X17	-0.26 F18	-0.24 F18	
Virden	-0.34 X17	-0.28 F18	-0.26 F18	
Palmyra	-0.34 X17	-0.28 F18	-0.26 F18	
Bunker Hill	-0.27 X17	-0.21 F18	-0.19 F18	
Chesterfield	-0.32 X17	-0.26 F18	-0.24 F18	
Girard	-0.34 X17	-0.28 F18	-0.26 F18	
Thomasville	-0.34 X17	-0.28 F18	-0.26 F18	
Irving	-0.32 X17	-0.26 F18	-0.24 F18	
Barnett	-0.29 X17	-0.23 F18	-0.21 F18	
Litchfield	-0.29 X17	-0.23 F18	-0.21 F18	
Alhambra	-0.25 X17	-0.19 F18	-0.17 F18	

WHEAT	June / July 17	AUG 17	
Carlinville	-0.1 N17	-0.27 U17	
Virden	-0.12 N17	-0.29 U17	
Palmyra	-0.12 N17	-0.29 U17	
Bunker Hill	-0.05 N17	-0.22 U17	
Chesterfield	-0.1 N17	-0.27 U17	
Girard	-0.12 N17	-0.29 U17	
Thomasville	-0.12 N17	-0.29 U17	
Irving	-0.1 N17	-0.27 U17	
Barnett	-0.07 N17	-0.24 U17	
Litchfield	-0.07 N17	-0.24 U17	
Alhambra	-0.03 N17	-0.2 U17	



**M&M Service Company**

Tuesday, June 27, 2017  
3:42:13 PM

CROP YEAR 18/19

**TERMINAL BASIS**

CORN	OCT / NOV 2018				
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	-0.1 Z18				
CENTER ETHANOL - Sauget					
GREEN PLAINS					
ADM - Decatur					
BEST BN BID					
BARTLETT - S. Jacksonville					

BEANS	OCT / NOV 2018				
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	X18				
ADM - Decatur					

WHEAT	JUNE / JULY 18				
STL MKT - BARGE LOADER	N18				
MENNEL MILLING - Mt Olive					

CBOT symbol	=	Futures month
F	=	January
H	=	March
K	=	May
N	=	July
Q	=	August
U	=	September
X	=	November
Z	=	December

CROP YEAR 18/19

**ELEVATOR BASIS**

CORN	Sep / Oct / Nov 18				
Carlinville	-0.3 Z18				
Virden	-0.3 Z18				
Palmyra	-0.3 Z18				
Bunker Hill	-0.3 Z18				
Chesterfield	-0.3 Z18				
Girard	-0.3 Z18				
Thomasville	-0.3 Z18				
Irving	-0.3 Z18				
Barnett	-0.3 Z18				
Litchfield	-0.3 Z18				
Alhambra	-0.3 Z18				

BEANS	Sep / Oct / N 0				
Carlinville	-0.3 X18				
Virden	-0.3 X18				
Palmyra	-0.3 X18				
Bunker Hill	-0.3 X18				
Chesterfield	-0.3 X18				
Girard	-0.3 X18				
Thomasville	-0.3 X18				
Irving	-0.3 X18				
Barnett	-0.3 X18				
Litchfield	-0.3 X18				
Alhambra	-0.3 X18				

WHEAT	JUNE / JULY 18				
Carlinville	N18				
Virden	N18				
Palmyra	N18				
Bunker Hill	N18				
Chesterfield	N18				
Girard	N18				
Thomasville	N18				
Irving	N18				
Barnett	N18				
Litchfield	N18				
Alhambra	N18				